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EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

Four key policy barriers are explored: 

Key recommendations
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Key messages

BARRIER 1: UNCLEAR AND
INSECURE TENURE
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Case study

Madagascar's GELOSE law (
                  secure local management) permits
the transfer of forest and mangrove
management rights from the state to a local
community (Law 96-025). The terms of the
transfer are defined by a contract and a
management plan developed through a
participatory approach with the local
community. The management plan designates
three types of zone: conservation zones,
reforestation zones and zones for local use. 

Once approved by the Forestry Department,
the authority to manage forest and mangrove
resources is delegated to a community-based
association, a non-governmental group of
volunteers within a local community. 
Commercial exploitation of forests and
mangroves by communities is prohibited, but
some use of wood ­ for example for the
construction of local homes ­ is permitted.
Such provisions are vital to ensure
communities’ basic needs are met and to
sustain local support for broader management
and conservation objectives. 

Communities where management
responsibility has not been transferred have to
seek permission formally from local authorities
every time they wish to harvest wood, a
lengthy and burdensome process. 

In recent years, the promise of the GELOSE
mechanism has been constrained by a
nationwide ban (interministerial decree
n°32100/2014) on the harvesting of mangrove
wood, even for local uses. The passing of this
decree has in effect prohibited the inclusion of
local use zones in GELOSE management plans,
limiting communities to conservation and
reforestation areas only. The result is a greater
burden of mangrove management on
communities, but without the benefit of easier
access to mangrove wood for local sustainable
use. As such, the speed of adoption of the
GELOSE mechanism has slowed substantially.

At the same time, mangrove cutting by
commercial charcoal producers ­ to supply
urban markets with charcoal for cooking fuel ­
continues largely unabated, due to patchy
enforcement and control by Malagasy
authorities. Charcoal production is one of the
primary drivers of mangrove deforestation in
Madagascar, with illicit charcoal producers
continuing to ply their trade with relative
impunity, due to low enforcement. Meanwhile
coastal communities seeking formal permission
to manage their mangroves sustainably fall
foul of one law prohibiting what another
specifically endorses.

A promising legal framework for community-based management

in Madagascar in conflict with a national ban on mangrove cutting
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BARRIER 2: INEQUITABLE
BENEFIT SHARING
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Case study

The Sundarbans is the world’s largest estuarine
mangrove forest and spans more than
10,000km2 of India and Bangladesh along the
Bay of Bengal. It is home to threatened species
including the Bengal tiger and Indian python, as
well as more than seven million people, for
whom the mangroves are a vital defence
against tides and cyclones. However, rising sea
levels and coastal erosion are rapidly reducing
the land area, and have so far forced more than
a million people to migrate north.

To help counteract these threats, the India
Sundarbans Mangrove Restoration project has
planted more than 16 million mangroves since
launching in 2011. These plantations will store
a projected 700,000t of CO₂ over the project’s
20-year lifespan. A collaboration between the
Indian NGO Nature Environment and Wildlife
Society and international impact investor
Livelihoods, the principal objectives of the
project are carbon emission reductions, climate
adaptation and biodiversity conservation. In
2015, the project was validated by VCS, with
emission reduction credits issued to Livelihoods
as part of an offset strategy for their investors
(Danone, Schneider Electric, Michelin, and
others).

The project costs, which include supporting
local community restoration activities, are
covered by Livelihoods. Community members
known as “forest friends” helped mitigate
threats such as grazing, earning $45 USD per
month. The project later transitioned to a
voluntary monitoring system and began
rewarding community members for raising
seedlings, planting mangroves and managing
the project locally. Planting - now long since
completed - provided an alternative livelihood
of $50-56 USD per month. Project managers
and field officers earn between $120 and $225
USD per month, while those doing the raising
are paid per sapling, with prices ranging from
0.015 to 0.0375 USD per sapling.

The project is a successful example of a larger-
scale VCS initiative in which benefits are
distributed among communities for restoration
work. It has reached its financial and
conservation targets, restoring more than
5,000 hectares of mangrove and impacting
250,000 people. There are also indications that
the amount of carbon sequestered is almost
three times what was originally projected at
the outset of the project.

A successful mangrove restoration project in 

the Sundarbans, India27
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BARRIER 3: MISALIGNMENT
BETWEEN SMALL-SCALE BLUE
CARBON PROJECTS AND
NATIONAL REDD+
FRAMEWORKS
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Case study

In Vietnam’s Mekong delta, the major threat to
mangroves comes from shrimp farming, which
destroys mangrove forests to produce
aquaculture ponds. To reduce these impacts
and provide incentives for mangrove
conservation, in 2013 the International Union
for the Conservation of Nature (IUCN) and
SNV Netherlands Development Organisation
launched the Mangrove and Markets project.
The developers had originally expected that
carbon financing through the REDD+
mechanism would be the economic
cornerstone of the project, but soon discovered
that organic shrimp certification could be a less
burdensome and more lucrative alternative.
The certification process delivered a price
premium for shrimp greater than the
opportunity cost of cutting mangroves.
Certified farms are not permitted to clear
mangroves, and must either maintain or
achieve 50% mangrove coverage, creating
incentives for farmers to restore or conserve
their mangroves. As such, although the project
does not incorporate a REDD+ financing
component, it achieves emission reduction
goals through alternative means and also
boosts the profitability of the shrimp industry
in Vietnam. 

Weighing the costs and benefits of pursuing a mangrove blue

carbon project under the national REDD+ framework in the

Mekong Delta, Vietnam
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Case study

Tahiry Honko is Madagascar’s first community-
led mangrove carbon conservation project.
Developed by the NGO Blue Ventures in
partnership with the Velondriake fishers’
association, the project is helping to tackle
climate breakdown and build community
resilience by preserving and restoring
mangrove forests in southwest Madagascar. It
was validated by Plan Vivo in 2019. 

Madagascar’s REDD+ policy framework is well
defined and includes mangroves, but has not
yet been formally adopted and remains a draft
decree. Tahiry Honko was developed
simultaneously, but independently from the
promulgation of the decree, leading to some
misalignments. 

For example, Plan Vivo as the certifier requires
projects to distribute at least 60% of revenues
to community partners. The government’s
draft REDD+ decree stipulates that 27% of
funds should go to the REDD+ National
Coordination Office, leaving 13% of funds
available for project validation and external
verification costs. Where this would be
sufficient in larger projects, in this small scale
scenario the funding for validation and
verification is insufficient. 

For now, Blue Ventures has covered these costs
from alternative means, but this throws into
question the affordability of this model and
thus its prospects for replication in other small-
scale settings elsewhere. 

Further, with the government decree not yet
enacted, transfers of funds from investors to
Blue Ventures and local communities are
blocked, undermining the project and risking
further deforestation. Blue Ventures has
fronted the income from the sale of blue
carbon credits to community partners as an
interim solution, until these blockages are
resolved.

Challenges integrating Madagascar’s Tahiry Honko mangrove blue

carbon project with the national REDD+ framework 
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BARRIER 4: COMPLEXITIES FOR
BLUE CARBON IN THE PARIS
AGREEMENT AND NDCS
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Case study

Managing flood risk by incorporating
nature-based solutions, including
mangrove restoration;
Rehabilitating and conserving degraded
forests, including mangroves;
Enhancing governance structures in
participatory resource management in
coastal ecosystems;
Conducting blue carbon readiness
assessment for full integration of blue
carbon/ocean climate actions into NDCs;
Integrating the use of nature-based
solutions into national and county
development plans, including the
implementation of a national mangrove
management plan.

Looking to 2030, adaptation is a top priority
for Kenya - not only preventing further damage
and losses, but mainstreaming climate change
adaptation throughout its national and county-
level development plans. To this end, Kenya
has incorporated several key activities in its
adaptation NDCs:

The total cost of implementing Kenya’s
mitigation and adaptation actions is estimated
at $62 billion over the next 10 years. Kenya has
committed to bear 13% of these costs from
the domestic budget, with the remaining 87%
to come from international support in the form
of finance, technology development and
transfer, and capacity building. For the
adaptation costs themselves, a full 90% will
need to be covered from this international
support. 

Kenya’s blue carbon adaptation NDCs 
39

Recommendations for
policy makers
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